
$339,900 - 208 Coverdale RD Unit#308
 

Listing ID: M154154

$339,900
2 Bedrooms, 2 Bathrooms, 1486 square feet
Single Family

208 Coverdale RD Unit#308, Riverview,
New Brunswick, E1B0M7

Welcome/Bienvenue to 208 Coverdale Road
Unit #308 Riverview, Bella Casa
Condominiums. Located on the third floor
backing onto the Moncton Golf & Country
Club where you can watch the golfers
making their way from the fairway to the
green. As you walk into the unit you will
find an open-concept TV Den and a
spacious living room with patio doors to the
deck, on your right you have your well-
appointed kitchen with lots of cupboard
space and a Dining room to entertain your
guest. The large Primary Bedroom offers
plenty of space for your furniture, a walk-in
closet, and a spacious ensuite with a jetted
soaker tub and shower. The other good-
sized bedroom, 4 pcs Bath, and
Laundry/storage room complete this GEM.
Luxury living in a safe environment the
building offers a social common room, gym,
outside patio on ground level, elevator, and
underground parking with a storage area.
Near all amenities Riverview has to offer
and just a short distance to Gunningsville
Bridge that brings you to Downtown
Moncton. For outdoor enthusiasm, if Golf is
not your thing across your front door you
will find the beautiful Riverfront
walking/biking trail. Make sure to put this
one on your list to view as you will not be
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disappointed. Call your REALTOR® for
your private viewing. (id:33159)
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